
Appendix 1C: Comments from Regional and Local Agencies and Responses 

1C.1.9 Northern California Water Association and Glenn-Colusa 
Irrigation District  
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Association and Glenn-Colusa Irrigation District 
NCWA GCID 1: Comment noted. 

NCWA GCID 2: As described in Section 3.3, Reclamation had provisionally 
accepted the provisions of the 2008 USFWS BO and 2009 NMFS BO, and was 
implementing the BOs at the time of publication of the Notice of Intent in March 
2012.  Under the definition of the No Action Alternative in the National 
Environmental Policy Act regulations (43 CFR 46.30), Reclamation’s NEPA 
Handbook (Section 8.6), and Question 3 of the Council of Environmental 
Quality’s Forty Most Asked Questions, the No Action Alternative could represent 
a future condition with “no change” from current management direction or level 
of management intensity, or a future “no action” conditions without 
implementation of the actions being evaluated in the EIS.  The No Action 
Alternative in this EIS is consistent with the definition of “no change” from 
current management direction or level of management.  Therefore, the RPAs were 
included in the No Action Alternative as Reclamation had been implementing the 
BOs and RPA actions, except where enjoined, as part of CVP operations for 
approximately three years at the time the Notice of Intent was issued (2008 
USFWS BO implemented for three years and three months, 2009 NMFS BO 
implemented for two years and nine months).   

As described in Section 3.3, Reclamation included the Second Basis of 
Comparison to identify changes that would occur due to actions that would not 
have been implemented without Reclamation’s provisional acceptance of the 
BOs, as required by the District Court order.  However, the Second Basis of 
Comparison is not consistent with the definition of the No Action Alternative 
used to develop the No Action Alternative for this EIS.  Therefore, mitigation 
measures have not been considered for changes of alternatives as compared to the 
Second Basis of Comparison. 

The analysis in the EIS includes hydrologic conditions projected to occur in 2030 
with existing regulatory requirements, future population growth in areas located 
north of the Delta, climate change, and sea level rise, as described in Appendix 
5A, Section A, CalSim II and DSM2 Modeling.  These changes are not caused by 
changes in CVP and SWP operations, and would occur with or without 
implementation of the BOs or other actions in the alternatives.  Because these 
changes are included in the No Action Alternative, Second Basis of Comparison, 
and Alternatives 1 through 5, the effects of these changes are not considered in 
the comparative analysis used in this EIS to determine effects of the alternatives.   

NCWA GCID 3: The alternatives considered in the EIS were analyzed over a 
wide range of hydrologic conditions, including drought conditions in 1927 
through 1934 and 1987 through 1992.  The CalSim II model assumptions include 
assumptions for compliance with federal and state regulatory requirements.  The 
model results indicate that CVP and SWP water deliveries under critical dry 
periods is minimal.  For example, water deliveries to CVP and SWP water 
contractors (not water rights holders, settlement, or exchange contractors) would 
average about 22 to 30 percent of full contract amounts under critical dry year 
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CalSim II and DSM2 Model Results (see Table 5A.B.1 in Appendix 5A, Section 
B, CalSim II and DSM2 Modeling Simulations and Assumptions, for full contract 
amounts).  The CalSim II model does not represent historical annual responses to 
extreme conditions by Reclamation, DWR, and other agencies to manage adverse 
conditions associated with wide range of water users, as described in Section 5.3 
of Chapter 5, Surface Water Resources and Water Supplies, in the Final EIS.  
Additional details have been included in Section 5.3 to describe recent CVP 
operations that delivered water to the San Joaquin River Exchange Contractors 
from Millerton Lake. 

NCWA GCID 4: The No Action Alternative, Second Basis of Comparison, and 
Alternatives 1 through 5 all include hydrologic and water quality conditions with 
climate change and sea level rise at Year 2030.  Because the EIS analysis is based 
upon a comparison of Alternatives 1 through 5 to the No Action Alternative, and 
a comparison of the No Action Alternative and Alternatives 1 through 5 to the 
Second Basis of Comparison, the effects of climate change and sea level rise are 
not included in the incremental differences between the alternatives.  Therefore, 
the relative incremental differences between the alternatives at Year 2030 are 
representative of the differences between the alternatives with or without climate 
change and sea level rise.  

NCWA GCID 5: Comment noted. 

On October 9, 2015, the District Court granted a very short time extension to 
address comments received during the public review period, and requires 
Reclamation to issue a Record of Decision on or before January 12, 2016.  This 
current court ordered schedule does not provide sufficient time for Reclamation to 
include additional alternatives, which would require recirculation of an additional 
Draft EIS for public review and comment, nor does Reclamation believe 
additional analysis is required to constitute a sufficient EIS.  Reclamation is 
committed to continue working toward improvements to the USFWS and NMFS 
RPA actions through either the adaptive management process, Collaborative 
Science and Adaptive Management Program (CSAMP) with the Collaborative 
Adaptive Management Team (CAMT), or other similar ongoing or future efforts. 
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1C.1.10 Oakdale Irrigation District, South San Joaquin Irrigation 
District, and Stockton East Water District  
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1C.1.10.1 Attachments to Comments from Oakdale Irrigation District, 
South San Joaquin Irrigation District, and Stockton East 
Water District 

Attachments to the Oakdale Irrigation District, South San Joaquin Irrigation 
District, and Stockton East Water District Comment letter are included in 
Attachment 1C.2 located at the end of Appendix 1C. 

1C.1.10.2 Responses to Comments from Oakdale Irrigation District, South 
San Joaquin Irrigation District, and Stockton East Water District 

OID SSJID SEWD 1: Comment noted. 

OID SSJID SEWD 2: The text on page 1-10 in Chapter 1, Introduction, provides 
a summary of information that is presented in Chapter 5, Surface Water 
Resources and Water Supplies, and Appendix 3A, No Action Alternative: Central 
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Draft EIS has been modified in the Final EIS to include a reference to additional 
details in Chapter 5 and Appendix 3A. 

OID SSJID SEWD 3: The text in this section of Chapter 1 of the Draft EIS 
(Section 1.6) has been modified in the Final EIS to include a reference to the 
ongoing SWRCB update of the Water Quality Control Plan.   

As described in Section 1.6 of Chapter 1, Introduction, of the Draft EIS, it is 
anticipated that substantial changes could occur to CVP and SWP operations as 
future projects are implemented.  It is anticipated that most of these future 
projects have been identified in Section 3.5 of Chapter 3, Description of 
Alternatives, including the Bay Delta Water Quality Control Plan Update.  Many 
of these future projects have not been fully defined and are not anticipated to be 
operational until the late 2020s.  If any of these future projects would substantially 
change CVP operations, Reclamation would evaluate the need to request for 
initiation of consultation under ESA with the USFWS and NMFS. 

The future projects are being developed for different project objectives than the 
purpose and need in this EIS for the coordinated long-term operation of the CVP 
and SWP.  Because the future operations under future projects have not been 
finalized at this time; and because projects that would substantially change CVP 
operations would require future consultations with USFWS and NMFS, it would 
be pre-decisional to include these projects in the alternatives evaluated in this EIS. 
Therefore, the alternatives under these future projects are considered in the 
cumulative effects analysis in this EIS. 

OID SSJID SEWD 4: In August 2012, Reclamation sent over 700 invitations to 
participate as a NEPA cooperating agency in development of this EIS, including 
an invitation to South San Joaquin Irrigation District (SSJID).  The invitation 
directed interested parties to respond to Reclamation with a written request.  
Reclamation has no record of a letter from SSJID requesting to be a cooperating 
agency.  However, SSJID has been invited to update meetings and included in 
preliminary review of written materials that were used in preparation of this EIS. 

OID SSJID SEWD 5: The study referenced in this comment is presented in 
Section 1.8 on page 1-15 of the DEIS as “Bay-Delta Water Quality Control Plan 
Update.” 

OID SSJID SEWD 6: The alternatives are described in detail in Sections 3.4.3 
through 3.4.7 in Chapter 3, Description of Alternatives, including operational 
details.  The description of the alternatives is complex because the range of 
alternatives represents a variety of methods to operate individual CVP and SWP 
operational actions. 

OID SSJID SEWD 7: The text on page 5-36, lines 10 through 16 has been 
modified to be consistent with reference “SWRCB 2012” which is used in 
development of the following paragraph. 

OID SSJID SEWD 8: The analysis in the EIS is conducted using a monthly 
analysis with an 82-year historic hydrology modified for projected climate 
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average monthly and annual conditions for the long-term average and averages 
under five water year types.  The analysis does not consider firm yield concepts. 

OID SSJID SEWD 9: The sentence referred to in this comment has been deleted 
from the Final EIS. 

OID SSJID SEWD 10: Reclamation operates the CVP to meet water rights and 
other agreements, including the 1988 stipulation agreement related to the 
Stanislaus River. 

OID SSJID SEWD 11: As stated on pages 5-36 and 5-37, additional CVP and 
SWP operational details, including discussions of SWRCB D-1641 objectives, are 
included in Appendix 3A.  The Vernalis Adaptive Management Program allowed 
for additional sources of water, other than New Melones Reservoir, to be used to 
maintain flow in the San Joaquin River.  After completion of this program, 
Reclamation does not have sufficient supply available in New Melones Reservoir 
to meet the inflow targets suggested by this comment. 

Additional details about the recent droughts have been included in Section 5.3.3 
of Chapter 5, Surface Water Resources and Water Supplies, and Section 6.3.3.6 of 
Chapter 6, Surface Water Quality, in the Final EIS to describe historical responses 
by CVP and SWP to these drought conditions. 

OID SSJID SEWD 12: Information related to Goodwin Reservoir is included 
because the fisheries analysis evaluates reservoir fish in this water body in 
Chapter 9, Fish and Aquatic Resources. 

OID SSJID SEWD 13: Please refer to the response to Comment OID SSJID 
SEWD 11. 

OID SSJID SEWD 14: As described in Section 5A.2.1.1.4 of Appendix 5A, the 
water demands for Oakdale Irrigation District and South San Joaquin Irrigation 
District in the CalSim II model for Year 2030 operations are up to a total of 
600,000 acre-feet per year depending upon land use.  The model is used to 
analyze long-term conditions by the Year 2030, and does include an assumed 
water demand of 526,000 acre-feet for long-term conditions by Year 2030. 

OID SSJID SEWD 15: The assumed water demands for water rights holders are 
not reduced in the CalSim II model assumptions, and water is delivered in 
accordance with water rights and agreements, as described in Appendix 5A, 
Section B.  However, it is recognized that some alternatives considered in this EIS 
limit the ability to deliver water to meet the water right demands.  

OID SSJID SEWD 16: The No Action Alternative, Second Basis of Comparison, 
and Alternatives 1 through 5 include climate change and sea level rise conditions.  
The EIS assumes that there will be no changes in regulatory or operational 
requirements due to climate change in the future.  The EIS analyzes the 
alternatives in a comparative manner, and does not analyze any of the alternatives 
in an absolute manner.  Therefore, the impact analysis compares conditions under 
the Alternatives 1 through 5 to the No Action Alternative; and conditions under 
the No Action Alternative and Alternatives 1 through 5 to the Second Basis of 

Final LTO EIS 1C-99  



Appendix 1C: Comments from Regional and Local Agencies and Responses 

Comparison.  This comparative approach minimizes effects of climate change and 1 
2 
3 

4 
5 
6 
7 
8 
9 

10 
11 
12 
13 
14 
15 
16 

17 
18 
19 
20 
21 
22 
23 

24 
25 
26 
27 
28 
29 
30 

31 
32 
33 
34 
35 
36 
37 
38 
39 

40 
41 
42 
43 
44 

sea level rise and indicates the differences in the comparisons of alternatives to 
the No Action Alternative and Second Basis of Comparison. 

OID SSJID SEWD 17: The exceedance curves shown in Appendix 5A, Section 
C, CalSim II and DSM2 Model Results (see Figures C.6.1 through C.6.3) present 
the results of the CalSim II model runs, including the minimum and maximum 
results, for the New Melones Reservoir storage.  The exceedance values at 10 
percent increments are presented in Tables C.6.1 through C.6.6 which also are 
included in Appendix 5A, Section C. 

OID SSJID SEWD 18: As described in Comment OID SSJID SEWD 17, the 
exceedance curves shown in Appendix 5A, Section C, CalSim II and DSM2 
Model Results (see Figures C.6.1 through C.6.3) present the results of the CalSim 
II model runs, including the minimum and maximum results, for the New 
Melones Reservoir storage.  The exceedance values at 10 percent increments are 
presented in Tables C.6.1 through C.6.6 which also are included in Appendix 5A, 
Section C. 

OID SSJID SEWD 19: As described in Comment OID SSJID SEWD 17, the 
exceedance curves shown in Appendix 5A, Section C, CalSim II and DSM2 
Model Results (see Figures C.6.1 through C.6.3) present the results of the CalSim 
II model runs, including the minimum and maximum results, for the New 
Melones Reservoir storage.  The exceedance values at 10 percent increments are 
presented in Tables C.6.1 through C.6.6 which also are included in Appendix 5A, 
Section C. 

OID SSJID SEWD 20: The No Action Alternative represents a continuation of 
existing policy and management actions at the time of the publication of the 
Notice of Intent in 2012.    The Vernalis Adaptive Management Program allowed 
for additional sources of water, other than New Melones Reservoir, to be used to 
maintain flow in the San Joaquin River.  After completion of this program, 
Reclamation does not have sufficient supply available in New Melones Reservoir 
to meet the inflow targets suggested by this comment. 

OID SSJID SEWD 21: This information is presented in the Affected 
Environment to provide an understanding of potential changes in San Joaquin 
River water temperatures downstream of the confluence with the Stanislaus River.  
Changes in water temperatures at the confluence of the Stanislaus River and the 
San Joaquin River are calculated in the EIS, and are indicative of potential 
changes in fisheries conditions on the San Joaquin River downstream of the 
Stanislaus River.  It is recognized that ambient air temperature conditions become 
a more dominant factor than upstream water temperatures as the San Joaquin 
River enters the Delta. 

OID SSJID SEWD 22: As described in the EIS, the model results indicate that 
there will be periods that the temperature objectives would not be achieved under 
the No Action Alternative, Second Basis of Comparison, and Alternatives 1 
through 5.  The EIS considers the changes in Stanislaus River water temperatures 
under Alternatives 1 through 5 as compared to the No Action Alternative and 
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the Second Basis of Comparison (see Figures 6B.17.1 through 6B.17.12 and 
6B.18.1 through 6B.18.12). 

OID SSJID SEWD 23: In Chapter 9, Fish and Aquatic Resources, references to 
Goodwin Lake has been replaced by references to the water body formed by 
Goodwin Dam. 

OID SSJID SEWD 24: In response to this comment, a quantitative description of 
the temporal and geographic distribution of fall-run Chinook Salmon spawning in 
the Stanislaus River has been added to Section 9.3.4.17.1 of the Draft EIS and 
somewhat conflicting language has also been removed from this section. 

OID SSJID SEWD 25: The text referenced in this comment has been modified in 
the Final EIS to include a discussion of straying of Chinook Salmon in the 
Stanislaus River.  

OID SSJID SEWD 26: In response to this comment, text has been added to the 
steelhead Section 9.3.4.17.1 describing the timing and numbers of steelhead 
observed in the Stanislaus River. The reference to spawning above Oakdale has 
been replaced with “between Goodwin Dam and Orange Blossom Bridge.” 

OID SSJID SEWD 27: The paragraph referenced in this comment has been 
deleted in the Final EIS. 

OID SSJID SEWD 28: The text referenced in this comment has been modified in 
the Final EIS to include the analysis of dissolved oxygen and migration of adult 
Chinook Salmon with references to Lee and Jones-Lee (2003) and SJTA (2012).   

OID SSJID SEWD 29: It is acknowledged that predation is an important factor 
influencing the survival of juvenile salmonids in the Stanislaus River.  The EIS 
addresses predation as a stressor on listed species and discusses it specifically for 
each of the water bodies analyzed, including the Stanislaus River.  The EIS also 
discusses predation in terms of predator management (see Draft EIS section 
starting on page 9-274). 

OID SSJID SEWD 30: The 7-day average of the daily maximums (7 DADM) 
prescribed in the NMFS OCAP BO is a management criterion designed to be 
measured in real-time. 
The Draft EIS uses average monthly temperatures to provide a comparison on 
ability of operations considered under alternatives to meet temperature objectives 
for species.  As described in Section 5A.A.3.6, temperature modeling is 
subsequent to CalSim II modeling that simulates operations on a monthly basis.  
As mentioned in Section 5A.A.3.5, regarding CalSim II model results and model 
results  interpretations dependent on CalSim II,  there are certain components in 
the model that are downscaled to daily time step (simulated or approximated 
hydrology) such as an air-temperature-based trigger for a fisheries action, the 
results of those daily conditions are always averaged to a monthly time step (for 
example, a certain number of days with and without the action is calculated and 
the monthly result is calculated using a day-weighted average based on the total 
number of days in that month), and operational decisions based on those 

Final LTO EIS 1C-101  



Appendix 1C: Comments from Regional and Local Agencies and Responses 

components are made on a monthly basis. Therefore, reporting sub-monthly 1 
2 
3 

4 
5 
6 
7 
8 
9 

10 
11 
12 

13 
14 
15 

results from CalSim II or from any other subsequent model that uses monthly 
CalSim results as an input is not considered an appropriate use of model results.  

It is acknowledged that temperature operations in real-time would be dependent 
on daily variations of meteorological conditions, reservoir operations, fish 
presence, and other external factors such as prolonged drought.  It is unfortunately 
not possible to capture all of these on a daily basis in a model.  Therefore, the 
Draft EIS uses model results in a comparative manner to provide a trend analysis 
rather than interpreting these results as absolute effects, which would be 
speculative. In addition, this comparative approach should capture the same 
differences regardless of whether monthly average temperatures or 7DADM were 
used.  This level of detail is deemed appropriate for a NEPA analysis. 

OID SSJID SEWD 31: Changes in water temperature depend on upstream 
reservoir storage, monthly flow patterns, and residence times in the downstream 
reservoirs.  Detailed discussion of such changes are provided in the EIS. 

 1C-102 Final LTO EIS 



Appendix 1C: Comments from Regional and Local Agencies and Responses 

1C.1.11 Placer County Water Agency 1 

2  

Final LTO EIS 1C-103  



Appendix 1C: Comments from Regional and Local Agencies and Responses 

 1 

 1C-104 Final LTO EIS 



Appendix 1C: Comments from Regional and Local Agencies and Responses 

 1 

Final LTO EIS 1C-105  



Appendix 1C: Comments from Regional and Local Agencies and Responses 

 1 

 1C-106 Final LTO EIS 



Appendix 1C: Comments from Regional and Local Agencies and Responses 

1C.1.11.1 Responses to Comments from Placer County Water Agency 1 
2 

3 
4 
5 
6 
7 

8 
9 

10 
11 
12 
13 
14 
15 
16 
17 
18 

PCWA 1: Comment noted. 

PCWA 2: The Sacramento River Water Reliability Project has been added to the 
list of related projects in Section 3.5 of Chapter 3, Description of Alternatives, 
and in the cumulative effects analyses in Chapters 5 through 21 of the EIS.  
Results of the impact analysis for all of the alternatives will be considered by 
Reclamation during preparation of the Record of Decision. 

PCWA 3: This project is still under development and is appropriate for inclusion 
in the cumulative effects analysis. The cumulative effects analysis for the EIS is a 
qualitative analyses due to the preliminary nature of the programs, projects, and 
policies considered under this analysis.  On October 9, 2015, the District Court 
granted a very short time extension to address comments received during the 
public review period, and requires Reclamation to issue a Record of Decision on 
or before January 12, 2016.  This current court ordered schedule does not provide 
sufficient time for Reclamation to incorporate detailed information about this 
project.  However, information related to this project from existing publically-
available references will be used in the analysis of cumulative effects during 
preparation of the Final EIS. 
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SAC 1: Comment noted.  

SAC 2: Comment noted. 

SAC 3: The CVP and SWP operations prioritize meeting federal and state 
statutory and regulatory requirements and obligations to senior water rights 
holders, including the City of Sacramento prior to deliveries of water to other 
CVP and SWP water contractors.  The modeling analyses presented in the EIS 
include these prioritizations for long-term operation of the CVP and SWP without 
inclusion of changes that could be developed for specific extreme flood or 
drought events.  Water is delivered every year under the water right contract to 
the City of Sacramento in the 82-year hydrology analyzed with the CalSim II 
model in the EIS. 

Reclamation is aware of the storage and diversion limitations that exist for the 
intakes in Folsom Lake during drought periods when Reclamation may be 
allocating and delivering water in consideration of federal and state regulatory 
requirements, including water rights.  Droughts have occurred throughout 
California’s history, and are constantly shaping and innovating the ways in which 
Reclamation and DWR balance both federal and state regulations, public health 
standards and urban and agricultural water demands.  The most notable droughts 
in recent history are the droughts that occurred in 1976-77, 1987-92, and the 
ongoing drought.  More details have been included in Section 5.3.3 of Chapter 5, 
Surface Water Resources and Water Supplies, in the Final EIS to describe 
historical responses by CVP and SWP to these drought conditions, including 
implementation of a barge and pump system in Folsom Lake to allow diversions 
when low water surface elevations would cause capacity issues for existing 
intakes.   

SAC 4: As described in Appendix 3A, No Action Alternative: Central Valley 
Project and State Water Project Operations, in the EIS, conditions in the Delta can 
change rapidly.  Weather conditions combined with tidal action can quickly affect 
Delta salinity conditions, and therefore, the Delta outflow required to maintain 
water quality criteria.  If, in this circumstance, it is decided the reasonable course 
of action is to increase upstream reservoir releases, then generally water is 
released from Folsom Reservoir first because the released water will reach the 
Delta before flows released from other CVP and SWP reservoirs.  Lake Oroville 
water releases require about 3 days to reach the Delta, while water released from 
Shasta Lake requires 5 days to travel from Keswick Reservoir to the Delta.  As 
water from the other reservoirs arrives in the Delta, Folsom Reservoir releases are 
generally adjusted downward. Water releases from Folsom Lake are determined 
based upon water rights in the American River watershed and federal and state 
statutory and regulatory requirements related to the operation of the CVP 
and SWP. 
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SAC 5: As described in the response to Comment SAC 3, water is delivered 1 
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every year under the water right contract to the City of Sacramento in the 82-year 
hydrology analyzed with the CalSim II model in the EIS.  The low Folsom Lake 
water storage conditions that occur during drought periods under the No Action 
Alternative, Second Basis of Comparison, and Alternatives 1 through 5 in the EIS 
occur after water is delivered in the CalSim II model to the City of Sacramento 
and other water rights holders in the American River watershed.  
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